
tral Government had the power to make rules under section 37 of the Central Excise Act, 1944, retrospectively, at all material times.
69. (1) The notifications of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue) number G.S.R. 679(E), dated the 25th August, 2003, number

G.S.R. 60(E), dated the 21st January, 2004 and number G.S.R. 419(E), dated the 9th July, 2004 (hereinafter referred to as the said notifications), issued under sub-section (1) of
section 5A of the Central Excise Act, 1944, shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended retrospectively, in the manner specified in column (3) of the
Ninth Schedule, on and from the corresponding date specified in column (4) of that Schedule, against each of the notifications specified in column (2) of that Schedule.

(2) Where a manufacturer avails the benefit of exemption provided under the said notifications as amended by sub-section (1), he shall, within a period of six months
from the date on which the Finance Bill, 2011 receives the assent of the President, provide details relating to the investments made in terms of condition (B) specified in
notifications number G.S.R. 679(E), dated the 25th August, 2003 and number G.S.R. 60(E), dated the 21st January, 2004, as subsequently amended by number G.S.R. 419(E),
dated the 9th July, 2004, to the Investment Appraisal Committee.

(3) The  Investment Appraisal Committee shall, on receipt of details under sub-section (2) and on being satisfied that the investment, as specified in condition (B)
referred to in sub-section (2),  has been made, issue the certificate in accordance with condition (E) specified in the said  notifications as soon as possible but not later than
the 31st day of December, 2012.

(4) Any amount lying or remaining unutilised in the escrow account [referred to in notification number G.S.R.419(E), dated the 9th July, 2004] on or after the 31st day of
December, 2012 shall stand forfeited and be appropriated to the account of the Central Government.

(5) Recovery of any duty along with applicable interest which has not been paid but was liable to be paid as if the benefits under the said notifications had not been
made available on account of non-issue of certificate by the Investment Appraisal Committee or on any other account, shall be made within a period of one year from the
31st day of December, 2012 and the provisions of the Central Excise Act, 1944 shall apply for such recovery.

(6) No suit or other proceedings shall be instituted, maintained or continued in any court, tribunal or any other authority for any action taken or anything done or
omitted to be done, in respect of the said notifications and no enforcement shall be made by any court of any decree or order relating to such action taken or anything
done or omitted to be done as if the amendments made in the said notifications had been in force at all material times.

(7) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to have the power to amend the said notifications with retrospective
effect as if the Central Government had the power to amend the said notifications under sub-section (1) of section 5A of the Central Excise Act, 1944, retrospectively, at all
material times.

Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not
have been so punishable if the said notifications had not been amended retrospectively.

Central Excise Tariff
70. In the Central Excise Tariff Act, 1985 (hereinafter referred to as the Central Excise Tariff Act),—

(a) the First Schedule shall,—
(i)   be amended in the manner specified in the Tenth Schedule;
(ii)  also be amended in the manner specified in the Eleventh Schedule with effect from the 1st day of January, 2012;  

(b) the Third Schedule shall be amended in the manner specified in the Twelfth Schedule.
CHAPTER  V

SERVICE TAX
71. In the Finance Act, 1994,—

(A) in section 65, save as otherwise provided, with effect from such date as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint,—
(1) clause (9) shall be omitted;
(2) for clause (25a), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

‘(25a) “clinical establishment” means—
(i) a hospital, maternity home, nursing home, dispensary, clinic, sanatorium or an institution, by whatever name called, owned, established, adminis-

tered or managed by any person or body of persons, whether incorporated or not, having in its establishment the facility of central air-conditioning either
in whole or in part of its premises and having more than twenty-five beds for in-patient treatment at any time during the financial year, offering services
for  diagnosis, treatment or care for illness, disease, injury, deformity, abnormality or pregnancy in any system of medicine; or

(ii) an entity owned, established, administered or managed by any person or body of persons, whether incorporated or not, either as an independent
entity or as a part of any clinical establishment referred to in sub-clause (i), which carries out diagnosis of diseases through pathological, bacteriological,
genetic, radiological, chemical, biological investigations or other diagnostic or investigative services with the aid of laboratory or other medical equip-
ment, 

but does not include an establishment, owned or controlled by—
(a) the Government; or
(b) a local authority;
(25aa) “club or association” means  any person or body of persons providing services, facilities or advantages, primarily to its members, for a subscription

or any other amount, but does not include—
(i) any body established or constituted by or under any law for the time being in force; or
(ii) any person or body of persons engaged in the activities of trade unions, promotion of agriculture, horticulture or animal husbandry; or
(iii) any person or body of persons engaged in any activity having objectives which are in the nature of public service and are of a charitable, religious

or political nature; or
(iv) any person or body of persons associated with press or media;’;

(3) in clause (27), the portion beginning with the words “but does not include’’ and ending with the words ‘‘time being in force’’ shall be omitted;
(4) in clause (104c), for the words “operational assistance for marketing”, the words “operational or administrative assistance in any manner” shall be substi-

tuted;
(5) in clause (105),—

(a) for sub-clause (zo), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:— 
“(zo) to any person, by any other person, in relation to any service for repair, reconditioning, restoration or decoration or any other similar services, of

any motor vehicle other than three wheeler scooter auto-rickshaw and motor vehicle meant for goods carriage;”;
(b) for sub-clause (zx), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(zx) to a policy holder or any person, by an insurer, including re-insurer carrying on life insurance business;”;
(c) in sub-clause (zzze), after the words “to its members,”, the words “or any other person” shall be inserted;
(d) for sub-clause (zzzzm), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

‘(zzzzm) (i) to any person, by a business entity, in relation to advice, consultancy or assistance in any branch of law, in any manner;
(ii) to any business entity, by any person, in relation to representational services before any court, tribunal or authority;
(iii) to any business entity, by an arbitral tribunal, in respect of arbitration.
Explanation.—For the purposes of this item, the expressions “arbitration” and “arbitral tribunal” shall have the meanings respectively assigned to

them in the Arbitration and Conciliation Act, 1996;’;
(e)  for sub-clause (zzzzo), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(zzzzo) to any person,—
(i) by a clinical establishment; or
(ii) by a doctor, not being an employee of a clinical establishment, who provides services from such premises for diagnosis, treatment or care for ill-

ness, disease, injury,  deformity, abnormality or pregnancy in any system of medicine;’’;
(f) after sub-clause (zzzzu), the following sub-clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(zzzzv) to any person, by a restaurant, by whatever name called, having the facility of air-conditioning in any part of the establishment, at any time
during the financial year, which has licence to serve alcoholic beverages, in relation to serving of food or beverage, including alcoholic beverages or both,
in its premises;

(zzzzw) to any person by a hotel, inn, guest house, club or campsite, by whatever name called, for providing of accommodation for a continuous period
of less than three months;”;

(B) in section 66, with effect from such date as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, for the word, brackets and letters
“and (zzzzu)”, the brackets, letters and word “, (zzzzu), (zzzzv) and (zzzzw)” shall be substituted;

(C)  in section 70, in sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
(D)  in section 73,—

(i) sub-section (1A) shall be omitted;
(ii) the provisos to sub-section (2) shall be omitted;
(iii) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(4A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (3) and (4), where during the course of any audit, investigation or verification, it is found that
any service tax has not been levied or paid or has been short-levied or short-paid or erroneously refunded, but the true and complete details of transactions are
available in the specified records, the person chargeable to service tax or to whom erroneous refund has been made, may pay the service tax in full or in part,
as he may accept to be the amount of tax chargeable or erroneously refunded along with interest payable thereon under section 75 and penalty  equal to one
per cent. of such tax, for each month, for the period during which the default continues, up to a maximum of twenty-five per cent. of the tax amount, before
service of notice on him and inform the Central Excise Officer of such payment in writing, who, on receipt of such information, shall not serve any notice
under sub-section (1) in respect of the amount so paid and proceedings in respect of the said amount of service tax shall be deemed to have been concluded:

Provided that the Central Excise Officer may determine the  amount of service tax, if any, due from such person, which in his opinion remains to be paid
by such person and shall proceed to recover such amount in the manner specified in sub-section (1). 
Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section and section 78, “specified records” means records including computerised data as are required to be main-

tained by an assessee in accordance with any law for the time being in force or where there is no such requirement, the invoices recorded by the assessee in the
books of account shall be considered as the specified records.’;
(E) in section 73B, after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that in the case of a service provider, whose value of taxable services provided in a financial year does not exceed sixty lakh rupees during
any of the financial years covered by the notice issued under sub-section (3) of section 73A or during the last preceding financial year, as the case may be, such rate
of interest shall be reduced by three per cent. per annum.”;
(F) in section 75, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in the case of a service provider, whose value of taxable services provided in a financial year does not exceed sixty lakh rupees during any of
the financial years covered by the notice or during the last preceding financial year, as the case may be,  such rate of interest, shall be reduced by three per cent. per
annum.”;
(G) in section 76,—

(i) for the words “two hundred rupees”, the words “one hundred rupees” shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words “two per cent.”, the words “one per cent.” shall be substituted;
(iii) in the proviso, after the words “shall not exceed”, the words “fifty per cent. of”  shall be inserted;
(iv) for the Illustration, the following Illustration shall be substituted, namely:—

“Illustration
X, an assessee, fails to pay service tax of ten lakh rupees payable by the 5th March. X pays the amount on the 15th March. The default has continued for ten

days. The penalty payable by X is computed as follows:—
1% of the amount of default for 10 days
Penalty calculated @ Rs.100 per day for 10 days = Rs.1,000
Penalty liable to be paid is Rs. 3226.00.”;

(H) in section 77, for the words “five thousand rupees” wherever they occur, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
(I) for section 78, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“78.(1) Where any service tax has not been levied or paid or has been short-levied or short-paid or erroneously refunded, by reason of—
(a) fraud; or
(b) collusion; or
(c) wilful mis-statement; or
(d) suppression of facts; or
(e) contravention of any of the provisions of this Chapter or of the rules made thereunder with the intent to evade payment of service tax,

the person, liable to pay such service tax or erroneous refund, as determined under sub-section (2) of section 73, shall also be liable to pay a penalty, in addition to such
service tax and interest thereon, if any, payable by him, which shall be equal to the amount of service tax so not levied or paid or short-levied or short-paid or erro-
neously refunded:

Provided that where true and complete details of the transactions are available in the specified records, penalty shall be reduced to fifty per cent. of the service
tax so not levied or paid or short-levied or short-paid or erroneously refunded:

Provided further that where such service tax and the interest payable thereon is paid within thirty days from the date of communication of order of the Cen-
tral Excise Officer determining such service tax, the amount of penalty liable to be paid by such person under the first proviso shall be twenty-five per cent. of
such service tax: 

Provided also that the benefit of reduced penalty under the second proviso shall be available only if the amount of penalty so determined has also been paid
within the period of thirty days referred to in that proviso:

Provided also that in case of a service provider whose value of taxable services does not exceed sixty lakh rupees during any of the years covered by the notice
or during the last preceding financial year, the period of thirty days shall be extended to ninety days. 

(2)  Where the service tax determined to be payable is reduced or increased by the Commissioner (Appeals), the Appellate Tribunal or, as the case may be, the
court, then, for the purposes of this section, the service tax as reduced or increased, as the case may be, shall be taken into account:

Provided that in case where the service tax to be payable is increased by the Commissioner (Appeals), the Appellate Tribunal or, as the case may be, the court,
then, the benefit of reduced penalty under the second proviso to sub-section (1), shall be available, if the amount of service tax so increased, the interest payable
thereon and twenty-five per cent. of the consequential increase of penalty have also been paid within thirty days or ninety days, as the case may be, of communi-
cation of the order by which such increase in service tax takes effect:

Provided further that if the penalty is payable under this section, the provisions of section 76 shall not apply.
Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that any amount paid to the credit of the Central Government prior to the date of

communication of the order referred to in the second  proviso to sub-section (1) or the first proviso to sub-section (2) shall be adjusted against the total amount due
from such person.”;

(J) in section 80, for the word and figures “section 78”, the words and figures “first proviso to sub-section (1) of section 78” shall be substituted; 
(K) in section 82, in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “Commissioner of Central Excise”, the words “Joint Commissioner of Central Excise” shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words “Assistant Commissioner of Central Excise or, as the case may be, Deputy Commissioner of Central Excise”, the words “Superintendent of

Central Excise” shall be substituted;
(L) in section 83,—

(i) for the figures and letters “9C, 9D, 11B, 11BB, 11C, 12, 12A, 12B, 12C, 12D, 12E, 14, 14AA, 15, 33A, 35F”, the figures and letters “9A, 9AA, 9B, 9C, 9D, 9E, 11B,
11BB, 11C, 12, 12A, 12B, 12C, 12D, 12E, 14, 14AA, 15, 33A, 34A, 35F’’ shall be substituted;

(ii) after the figures and letter ‘‘35Q’’, the figures and letter ‘‘35R’’ shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 20th day of
October, 2010; 
(M) after section 87, the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“88. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in any Central Act or State Act, any amount of duty, penalty, interest, or any other sum payable by
an assessee or any other person under this Chapter, shall, save as otherwise provided in section 529A of the Companies Act, 1956 and the Recovery of Debts Due to
Banks and the Financial Institutions Act, 1993 and the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and the Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002,
be the first charge on the property of the assessee or the person as the case may be. 

89.(1) Whoever commits any of the following offences, namely,—
(a) provides any taxable service chargeable to service tax under sub-section (1) of section 68 or receives any taxable service chargeable to tax under sub-sec-

tion (2) of said section, without an invoice issued in accordance with the provisions of this Chapter or the rules made thereunder; or
(b) avails and utilises credit of taxes or duty without actual receipt of taxable service or excisable goods either fully or partially in violation of the rules

made under the provisions of this Chapter; or
(c) maintains false books of account or fails to supply any information which he is required to supply under this Chapter or the rules made thereunder or

(unless with a reasonable belief, the burden of proving which shall be upon him, that the information supplied by him is true) supplies false information; or
(d) collects any amount as service tax but fails to pay the amount so collected to the credit of the Central Government beyond a period of six months from

the date on which such payment becomes due, 
shall be punishable,—

(i) in the case of an offence where the amount exceeds fifty lakh rupees, with imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years:
Provided that in the absence of special and adequate reasons to the contrary to be recorded in the judgment of the court, such imprisonment shall not

be for a term of less than six months;
(ii) in any other case, with imprisonment for a term, which may extend to one year.

(2) If any person convicted of an offence under this section is again convicted of an offence under this section, then, he shall be punishable for the second and
for every subsequent offence with imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years:

Provided that in the absence of special and adequate reasons to the contrary to be recorded in the judgment of the court, such imprisonment shall not be for
a term less than six months.

(3) For the purposes of sub-sections (1) and (2), the following shall not be considered as special and adequate reasons for awarding a sentence of imprison-
ment for a term of less than six months, namely:—

(i) the fact that the accused has been convicted for the first time for an offence under this Chapter;
(ii) the fact that in any proceeding under this Act, other than prosecution, the accused has been ordered to pay a penalty or any other action has been taken

against him for the same act which constitutes the offence;
(iii) the fact that the accused was not the principal offender and was acting merely as a secondary party in the commission of offence;

(iv) the age of the accused.
(4) A person shall not be prosecuted for any offence under this section except with the previous sanction of the Chief Commissioner of Central Excise.”;

(N) in section 93A, in the proviso, after the words “such rebate shall”, the words “, except under such circumstances or such conditions as may be prescribed,” shall
be inserted;

(O) in section 95, after sub-section (1G), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—
“(1H) If any difficulty arises in respect of implementing, classifying or assessing the value of any taxable service incorporated in this Chapter by the Finance

Act, 2011, the Central Government may, by order published in the Official Gazette, not inconsistent with the provisions of this Chapter, remove the difficulty:
Provided that no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period of one year from the date on which the Finance Bill, 2011 receives the assent of the Presi-

dent.”;
(P) after section 96-I, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“96J. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 66, no service tax shall be levied or collected in respect of membership fee  collected by a club or associ-
ation formed for representing  industry or commerce, during the period on and from the 16th day of June, 2005 to the 31st day of March, 2008 (both days inclusive).

(2) Refund shall be made of all such service tax which has been collected but which would not have been so collected if sub-section (1) had been in force at all
material times.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Chapter, an application for the claim of refund of service tax shall be made within six months from the date on
which the Finance Bill, 2011 receives the assent of the President.”.

72. (1) The notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue) number G.S.R. 492(E), dated the 7th July, 2009, issued in exer-
cise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 93 of the Finance Act, 1994, granting exemption from the whole of service tax leviable under section 66 of that Act
to any person by a tour operator having a contract carriage permit for inter-State or intra-State transportation of passengers, excluding tourism, conducted tour, charter
or hire service, shall be deemed to have, and deemed always to have, for all purposes, validly come into force on and from the 1st day of April, 2000, at all material times.

(2) Refund shall be made of all such service tax which has been collected but which would not have been so collected as if the notification referred to in sub-section (1)
had been in force at all material times.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Finance Act, 1994, an application for the claim of refund of service tax shall be made within six months from the date
on which the Finance Bill, 2011 receives the assent of the President.

Explanation.—For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that the provisions of section 11B of the Central Excise Act, 1944, shall be applicable in case of refunds
under this section. 

CHAPTER VI
MISCELLANEOUS

73. In the Schedule to the Medicinal and Toilet Preparations (Excise Duties) Act, 1955, in Explanation III, for the words, figures and brackets “Standards of Weights
and Measures Act, 1976 (60 of 1976)”, the words and figures  “Legal Metrology Act, 2009” shall be and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st day
of March, 2011.

74. In section 15 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956, in clause (a), for the words “four per cent.”, the words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.
75.The First Schedule to the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957 shall be amended in the manner specified in the Thirteenth Sched-

ule.
76. In the Second Schedule to the Special Economic Zones Act, 2005,—

(a) in paragraph (a), clause (C) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of June, 2011;
(b) paragraph (h) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 2012;
(c) paragraph (i) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of June, 2011.

Declaration under the Provisional Collection of Taxes Act, 1931
It is hereby declared that it is expedient in the public interest that the provisions of clauses 57(a)(i), 57(b) and 70(a)(i) of this Bill shall have immediate effect under the

Provisional Collection of Taxes Act, 1931.

(v) on income by way of interest payable on— 

(A) any debentures or securities for money issued by or on behalf of any local authority  or a 
corporation established by a Central, State or Provincial Act; 

 (B) any debentures issued by a company where such debentures are listed on a recognised stock 
exchange in India in accordance with the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956 (42 of 1956) and 
any rules made thereunder; 

(C) any security of the Central or State Government 

(vi) on any other income 

(b)  where the person is not resident in India— (i) in the 
case of a non-resident Indian— 

(A) on any investment income 

(B) on income by way of long-term capital gains referred to in section 115E (C) on income by way 
of short-term capital gains referred to in section 111A 
(D) on other income by way of long-term capital gains [not being long-term 

capital gains referred to in clauses (33), (36) and (38) of section 10] 

(E) on income by way of interest payable by Government or an Indian concern on moneys borrowed 
or debt incurred by Government or the Indian concern in foreign currency (not being income by way of 
interest referred to in section 194LB) 

 (F) on income by way of royalty payable by Government or an Indian concern in pursuance of an 
agreement made by it with the Government or the Indian concern where such royalty is in 
consideration for the transfer of all or any rights (including the granting of a licence) in respect of 
copyright in any book on a subject referred to in the first proviso to sub-section (1A) of section 115A 
of the 
Income-tax Act, to the Indian concern, or in respect of any computer software 
referred to in the second proviso to sub-section (1A) of section 115A of the Income- tax Act, to a person 
resident in India— 

(I) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 1997 but before the 1st day of 
June, 2005 

(II) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 2005 

(G) on income by way of royalty [not being royalty of the nature referred to in sub-item (b)(i)(F)] 
payable by Government or an Indian concern in pursuance of an agreement made by it with the 
Government or the Indian concern and where such agreement is with an Indian concern, the 
agreement is approved by the 
Central Government or where it relates to a matter included in the industrial policy, for the time being in 
force, of the Government of India, the agreement is in accordance with that policy— 

(I) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 1997 but before the 1st day of 
June, 2005 

(II) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 2005 

(H) on income by way of fees for technical services payable by Government or an Indian concern in 
pursuance of an agreement made by it with the Government or the Indian concern and where such 
agreement is with an Indian concern, the agreement is approved by the Central Government or where 
it relates to a matter 
included in the industrial policy, for the time being in force, of the Government of 
India, the agreement is in accordance with that policy— 

(I) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 1997 but before the 1st day of 
June, 2005 

(II) where the agreement is made on or after the 1st day of June, 2005 

 (I) on income by way of winnings from lotteries, crossword puzzles, card games and other games of 
any sort 

Rate of income-tax 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
 
 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
15 per cent.; 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
20 per cent.; 
 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
30 per cent.; 

PART II 

RATES FOR DEDUCTION  OF TAX AT SOURCE  IN CERTAIN  
CASES 

In every case in which under the provisions of sections 193, 194, 194A, 194B, 194BB, 194D and 195 of the Income-tax Act, tax 
is to be deducted at the rates in force, deduction shall be made from the income subject to the deduction at the following rates:— 
 
 

1. In the case of a person other than a company— (a) where the 
person is resident in India— 

(i) on income by way of interest other than "Interest on securities" 

(ii) on income by way of winnings from lotteries, crossword puzzles, card games and other 
games of any sort 

(iii) on income by way of winnings from horse races 

(iv) on income by way of insurance commission 

Rate of income-tax 
 
 
 
 
10 per cent.; 
 
30 per cent.; 
 
 
30 per cent.; 
 
10 per cent.; 

(4)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 8,00,000 
 
Rs. 91,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 8,00,000. 

(III) In the case of every individual, being a resident in India, who is of the age of sixty-five years or more at any time during the previous year,— 

Rates of income-tax 

(1)   where the total income does not exceed Rs. 2,40,000 

(2)   where the total income exceeds Rs. 2,40,000 but does not exceed Rs. 5,00,000 

(3)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 5,00,000 but does not 
exceed Rs. 8,00,000 

(4)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 8,00,000 

Nil; 
 
10 per cent. of the amount by which the total income exceeds Rs. 
2,40,000; 
 
Rs. 26,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 5,00,000; 
 
Rs. 86,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 8,00,000. 

In the case of every co-operative society,— 

Paragraph B 
 
 

Rates of income-tax 
(1)  where the total income does not exceed Rs.10,000 10 per cent. of the total income; 

(2)  where the total income exceeds Rs.10,000 but does Rs.1,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amount by not exceed Rs. 
20,000  which the total income exceeds Rs.10,000; 

(3)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 20,000 Rs. 3,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount by 
which the total income exceeds Rs. 20,000. 

THE FIRST SCHEDULE (See 
section 2) 

PART I 
INCOME-TAX 

Paragraph A 

(I) In the case of every individual other than the individual referred to in items (II) and (III) of this Paragraph or Hindu undivided family or association of 
persons or body of individuals, whether incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the 
Income-tax Act, not being a case to which any other Paragraph of this Part applies,— 

Rates of income-tax 

(1)  where the total income does not exceed Rs. 1,60,000 

(2)  where the total income exceeds Rs.1,60,000 but does not exceed Rs. 
5,00,000 

(3)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 5,00,000 but does 
not exceed Rs.  8,00,000 

(4)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 8,00,000 

Nil; 
 
10 per cent. of the amount by which the total income exceeds Rs. 
1,60,000; 
 
Rs. 34,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 5,00,000; 
 
Rs. 94,000 plus 30 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 8,00,000. 

(II) In the case of every individual, being a woman resident in India, and below the age of sixty-five years at any time during the previous year,— 
Rates of income-tax 

(1)   where the total income does not exceed Rs. 1,90,000 

(2)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 1,90,000 but does not exceed Rs. 
5,00,000 

(3)  where the total income exceeds Rs. 5,00,000 but does 
not exceed Rs. 8,00,000 

Nil; 
 
10 per cent. of the amount by which the total income exceeds Rs. 
1,90,000; 
 
Rs. 31,000 plus 20 per cent. of the amount by which the total income 
exceeds Rs. 5,00,000; 

CMYK

UNION BUDGET 2011-12
FINANCE BILL www.economictimes.com

TUESDAY 1 MARCH 2011 V

* E

* E
ETD10311/1R1/05/K/1

of india I����nk i
ThE BP�NKER TOPROUD TO BE INDI A N

o����
I

.ri DANKE TO EVE INO�N




